Vendor Name: Norix Group, Inc.

Solicitation 5400025637 - Statewide Term Contract for Mattresses

LOT 1 - Mattresses - Dormitory

Website for mattress catalog: www.norix.com

Item Description Manufacturer Item Number Unit Price
1 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Twin Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNF6-3675 213.85
2 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Twin Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNF6-3675 213.85
3 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Twin XL Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNF6-3680 213.85
4 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Twin XL Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNF6-3680 213.85
5 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Full Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
6 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Full Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
7 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Full XL Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNF6-5480 311.22
8 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Full XL Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNF6-5480 311.22
9 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Queen Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
10 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 6"D, Queen Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
11 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Twin Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNF6-3675 213.85
12 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Twin Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNF6-3675 213.85
13 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Twin XL Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNF6-3680 213.85
14 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Twin XL Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNF6-3680 213.85
15 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Full Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
16 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Full Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
17 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Full XL Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNF6-5480 311.22
18 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Full XL Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNF6-5480 311.22
19 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Queen Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
20 Foam Core Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Queen Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
21 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Twin Size, 210D Nylon Norix MRB6-3675-C1NA-5 323.05
22 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Twin Size, TPU Nylon Norix MRB6-3675-C1NA-5 323.05
23 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Twin XL Size, 210D Nylon Norix MRB6-3680-C1NA-5 323.05
24 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Twin XL Size, TPU Nylon Norix MRB6-3680-C1NA-5 323.05
25 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Full Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
26 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Full Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
27 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Full XL Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
28 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Full XL Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
29 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Queen Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
30 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 6"D, Queen Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
31 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Twin Size, 210D Nylon Norix MRB6-3675-C1NA-5 323.05
32 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Twin Size, TPU Nylon Norix MRB6-3675-C1NA-5 323.05
33 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Twin XL Size, 210D Nylon Norix MRB6-3680-C1NA-5 323.05
34 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Twin XL Size, TPU Nylon Norix MRB6-3680-C1NA-5 323.05
35 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Full Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
36 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Full Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
37 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Full XL Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
38 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Full XL Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
39 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Queen Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
40 Foam Core Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Queen Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
41 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Twin Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNE7-3675 237.51
42 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Twin Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNE7-3675 237.51
43 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Twin XL Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNE7-3680 237.51
44 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Twin XL Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNE7-3680 237.51
45 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Full Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
46 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Full Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
47 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Full XL Size, 210D Nylon Norix MNE7-5480 368.55
48 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Full XL Size, TPU Nylon Norix MNE7-5480 368.55
49 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Queen Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
50 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 8"D, Queen Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
51 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Twin Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
52 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Twin Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
53 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Twin XL Size, 210D Nylon NO BID




54 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Twin XL Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
55 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Full Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
56 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Full Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
57 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Full XL Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
58 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Full XL Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
59 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Queen Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
60 Inner Spring Mattress, Flippable, 10"D, Queen Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
61 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Twin Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
62 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Twin Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
63 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Twin XL Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
64 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Twin XL Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
65 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Full Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
66 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Full Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
67 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Full XL Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
68 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Full XL Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
69 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Queen Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
70 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 8"D, Queen Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
71 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Twin Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
72 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Twin Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
73 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Twin XL Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
74 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Twin XL Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
75 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Full Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
76 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Full Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
77 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Full XL Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
78 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Full XL Size, TPU Nylon NO BID
79 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Queen Size, 210D Nylon NO BID
80 Inner Spring Mattress, Non-flippable, 10"D, Queen Size, TPU Nylon NO BID

Non-Market Basket Discount Percentage

55%




